
Bid Tabulation RFB 33-31AUG21 

Bid Opening: RFB 33-31AUG21- Pre-Printed Envelopes for Collector 

Bid Tabulation QTY Bear Graphics McAuley Printing Co. Cenveo (1) St. Louis Print Group

(2) Edward J Rice

(3) Unipak

Line Item 4.10.1 150,000 $ 22.65 $ 26.52 $ 23.85 
#10 White Window Envelopes 24Ib, 

Single Sided, informational bubble on No Bid 
front, See Paragraph 2.2.1. 

Line Item 4.10.2 100,000 $ 26.18 $ 42.02 $ 29.65 
#10 Blue Window Envelopes 24Ib, 

No Bid 
Single Sided, See Paragraph 2.2.2. 

Line Item 4.10.3 115,000 $ 21.96 $ 40.15 $ 40.20 

#9 Yellow Insert Envelopes 24 lb. 

Double Sided, See Paragraph 2.2.3. No Bid 

Line Item 4.10.4 50,000 $ 21.30 $ 28.80 $ 31.00 
#9 White Insert envelopes 24 lb, 

Double Sided, See Paragraph 2.2.4. No Bid 

Line Item 4.10.5 5,000 $ 29.15 $ 46.00 $ 23.85 
#10 White Window Envelopes 24Ib, 

Single Sided, Informational bubble on No Bid 
front, see paragraph 2.2.5 

Line Item 4.10.6 $ 27.15 $ 42.00 $ 23.85 
#10 White Envelopes 24Ib, Single 

Sided, return address on front, see 5,000 No Bid 
paragraph 2.2.6 

Line Item 4.10.7 $ 26.35 $ 34.50 $ 23.85 
#10 White Window Envelopes 24Ib, 

10,000 No Bid 
Single Sided, return address on front, 
see paragraph 2.2.7 

Envelopes Grand Total: Quote the $ 10,150.90 $ 15,022.25 $ 13,192.50 

Grand Total Price for line items 4.10.1 

through 4.10.7 based on the 1 No Bid 

extended prices (total quantity 

extended price): 

Yes Yes Yes 

Co-Op 
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